CHARLESTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
PROCUREMENT SERVICES
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Number: 09-CP-B-01 Amendment: 1
Procurement Official: TammieS. Yeadon Tabulated By: Tammie S. Yeadon
Bid Issue Date: SEPTEMBER 11, 2009 Page: 10f1
Bid Open Date: OCTOBER 15, 2009 @ 2 PM Bid Titlee CTE FURNISHINGSFOR N.C.H.S& R.B STALL HIGH SCHOOL
Award MBE Vendor Submit Addendum | MECHATRONICS | TRANSPORTATION/ | HEALTH SCIENCE VIRTUAL MOBILE
. LOGISTICS ENTERPRISE PRESENTATION
Information CARTS
L] L] SOUTHERN YES YES $34,779.76 $28,791.39 PER $6,419.10 PER | $22,544.99 PER $749.00 PER
EDUCATIONAL PER UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
SYSTEMS
L] X HERALD YES YES NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID NO-BID
SYSTEMS $519.00 PER
UNIT
X ] ALFRED YES YES NO-BID $22,257.80 No-Bid $21,709.26 $446.48 PER
WILLIAMS (DID NOT BID UNIT
APPROVED
PRODUCT)
X L] WULBERN YES YES NO-BID $24,963.39 (DID NO-BID $21,362.42 PER $450.19 PER
KOVAL NOT BID UNIT UNIT
APPROVED
PRODUCT)
X L] MIDWEST YES YES $37,394.00 | $31,709.00 PER | 7140.00 PER | $24,831.00 PER NO-BID
PER UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT

NOTE: THE DOLLAR AMOUNTSARE THE TOTAL OF EACH UNIT PRICE (QUANTITY OF 1) WITHIN THAT GROUP. THE SHADED AMOUNTS REPRESENT THE LOW BID FOR THAT GROUP.




